VAN BUREN COUNTY ROAD COMMISSION
"SLAG and FINE AGGREGATE-MODIFIED FOR BITUMINOUS SEALCOAT
Monday, October 4, 2021 at 11:00 AM

Contractor Material 2022 Season 2023 Season 2024 Season
Price Per Ton | Price Per Ton | Price Per Ton
25-A Blast Furnace Slag | $45.00 $47.50 $50.00
29A Slag $55.00 $57.50 $60.00
34C Slag $55.00 $57.50 $60.00
Verplank
FA-2 Fine Aggregate- No Bid No Bid No Bid
Modified for Bituminous
Sealcoat
Alternate: $ $ $
Alternate: $ $ $
Alternate: $ $ $
25-A Blast Furnace Slag | $24.85 $26.00 $28.00
29A Slag $42.00 $43.75 $45.50
34C Slag $42.00 $43.75 $45.50
FA-2 Fine Aggregate- $ $ $
Yellow Rose Transport Modified for Bituminous
Sealcoat
Alternate: CST Slag $49.00 $53.00 $57.00
Alternate: CST Trap $54.00 $58.50 $64.00
Rock, as available
Alternate: 34CS Trap $45.50 $47.50 $49.50
Rock, as available
25-A Blast Furnace Slag | $21.49 $21.99 $22.49
29A Slag No Bid No Bid No Bid
34C Slag No Bid No Bid No Bid
FA-2 Fine Aggregate- No Bid No Bid No Bid
Kenneth Smith, Inc. Modified for Bituminous
Sealcoat
Alternate: $ $ $
Alternate: $ $ $
Alternate: $ $ $
25-A Blast Furnace Slag | $ $ $
29A Slag $ $ $
34C Slag $ $ $
FA-2 Fine Aggregate-
Carr Brothers & Sons Modified for Bituminous
Sealcoat
Alternate: 34CS-M* $34.50 $37.25 $40.50
Alternate: 28B-M $31.00 $33.75 $36.00
Alternate: $ $ $

*Quoting 5,500 ton each season of 34CS-M or 28B-M




