

Bid Tabulation

Lubricants and Fluids

December 11, 2022 at 11:00 AM

	<u>Vendor</u>	<u>Manufacturer</u>	<u>Unit Price</u>	<u>Unit</u>	<u>Bidding Option</u>
15W-40	Major Brands	Shell	\$ 9.990	Gal	3*
	Crystal Flash	Phillips 66	\$ 14.550		1
	Merle Boes	Shell	\$ 12.020		1
	J&H Oil	Phillips 66	\$ 13.152		1
	PriMar Petroleum	Citgo	\$ 11.290		1
10W-30	Major Brands	Shell	\$ 13.840	Gal	
	Crystal Flash	Phillips 66	\$ 14.730		
	Merle Boes	Shell	\$ 19.410		
	J&H Oil	Phillips 66	\$ 16.100		
	PriMar Petroleum	Citgo	\$ 13.990		
Tractor Hydraulic Oil	Major Brands	Shell	\$ 12.130	Gal	
	Crystal Flash	Phillips 66	\$ 14.160		
	Merle Boes	Shell	\$ 13.290		
	J&H Oil	Phillips 66	\$ 12.708		
	PriMar Petroleum	Citgo	\$ 11.290		
Synthetic Auto Trans Fluid	Major Brands	Shell	\$ 34.560	Gal	
	Crystal Flash	Citgo	\$ 25.700		
	Merle Boes	VP	\$ 27.990		
	J&H Oil	Phillips 66	\$ 15.643		
	PriMar Petroleum	Citgo	\$ 29.990		
Overdrive HD#2 Extreme Pressure Grease	Major Brands	Shell	\$ 499.000	120 Lb Drum	
	Crystal Flash	Phillips 66	\$ 438.800		
	Merle Boes	Shell	\$ 501.820		
	J&H Oil	Phillips 66	\$ 3.816	per Lb	
	PriMar Petroleum	Citgo	\$ 4.990		
High Temp JT6 #2 Grease	Major Brands	Shell	\$ 499.000	120 Lb Drum	
	Crystal Flash	Phillips 66	\$ 438.800		
	Merle Boes	Shell	\$ 501.820		
	J&H Oil	Phillips 66	\$ 3.816	per Lb	
	PriMar Petroleum	Mystik	\$ 4.290		
High Temp JT#2 Grease	Major Brands	Shell	\$ 199.000	35 Lb Bucket	
	Crystal Flash	Phillips 66	\$ 149.100		
	Merle Boes	Shell	\$ 189.340		
	J&H Oil	Phillips 66	\$ 3.888	per Lb	
	PriMar Petroleum	Mystik	\$ 4.290	??	
Grease (Lithium Complex #2)	Major Brands	Shell	\$ 35.720	Tube	
	Crystal Flash	Phillips 66	\$ 3.890		
	Merle Boes	Shell	\$ 4.700		
	J&H Oil	Phillips 66	NO BID		
	PriMar Petroleum	Mystik	\$ 4.990		
85-140 Gear Lube	Major Brands	Shell	\$ 1,192.000	55 Gal Drum	
	Crystal Flash	Phillips 66	\$ 1,049.950		
	Merle Boes	VP	\$ 830.000	??	
	J&H Oil	Phillips 66	\$ 2.412	per Lb	
	PriMar Petroleum	Citgo	\$ 3.990		
Bulk Fleetguard ES Compleat OAT Anti-freeze Coolant	Major Brands	Shell	\$ 8.620	Gallon	
	Crystal Flash	Peak	\$ 11.090		
	Merle Boes	Shell	\$ 7.350		
	J&H Oil	Starfire	\$ 6.280		
	PriMar Petroleum	NO BID			
Fleetguard ES Compleat OAT Anti-Freeze Coolant	Major Brands	Shell	\$ 399.890	55 Gal Drum	
	Crystal Flash	Peak	\$ 659.950		
	Merle Boes	Shell	\$ 415.250		
	J&H Oil	Starfire	\$ 6.280	??	
	PriMar Petroleum	NO BID			

Windshield Washer Fluid, all season, non-concentrate	Major Brands	Champion	\$ 126.330	55 Gal Drum	
	Crystal Flash	Peak	\$ 275.500		
	Merle Boes	BLANK	\$ 140.000		
	J&H Oil	Champion	\$ 8.020	??	
	PriMar Petroleum	NO BID			
Windshield Washer Fluid, all season, non-concentrate	Major Brands	Champion	\$ 12.990	Gallon	
	Crystal Flash	Peak	\$ 4.180		
	Merle Boes	BLANK	\$ 3.790		
	J&H Oil	Champion	\$ 3.270		
	PriMar Petroleum	NO BID			
Diesel Exhaust Fluid	Major Brands	Brenner	\$ 672.500	275 Gal Tote	
	Crystal Flash	Peak	\$ 2.430	Not specified	
	Merle Boes	BLANK	\$ 629.750	275 Gal Tote	
	J&H Oil	Blue Leaf	\$ 365.000	330 Gal Tote	
	PriMar Petroleum		\$ 3.290	330 Gal Tote	
* Bid prices are to remain in effect for 90 days from award of bid. We will review every 90 days and notify you 30 days prior of any announced increase.					