

VAN BUREN COUNTY ROAD COMMISSION
"EMULSIFIED ASPHALT/ASPHALT MATERIALS"
 THURSDAY, February 24, 2022 at 11:00 AM

Materials Requested	Company: Asphalt Materials	Company: mi Paving + Materials	Company: The Klink Group (Bit-Mat)	Company:	Company:	Company:
Portable Asphalt Patching Machine Emulsion	2.50 /gal.	No Bid /gal.	Ae-90 2.31 /gal.	/gal.	/gal.	/gal.
Chip Seal Emulsified Asphalt	2.75 /gal.	No Bid /gal.	Bm-90P 3.24 /gal.	/gal.	/gal.	/gal.
Fog Seal Emulsified Asphalt	1.65 /gal.	No Bid /gal.	ChipLock 1.78 /gal.	/gal.	/gal.	/gal.
HFRS-2	2.15 /gal.	No Bid /gal.	2.31 /gal.	/gal.	/gal.	/gal.
HFRS-2M	2.55 /gal.	No Bid /gal.	2.51 /gal.	/gal.	/gal.	/gal.
CSS-1h	2.25 /gal.	No Bid /gal.	No Bid /gal.	/gal.	/gal.	/gal.
CSS-1hM	2.85 /gal.	No Bid /gal.	No Bid /gal.	/gal.	/gal.	/gal.
CSEA	2.45 /gal.	2.67 /gal.	No Bid /gal.	/gal.	/gal.	/gal.
CRS-2M	2.40 /gal.	2.27 /gal.	2.50 /gal.	/gal.	/gal.	/gal.
CQSEA	1.65 /gal.	1.59 /gal.	No Bid /gal.	/gal.	/gal.	/gal.
Alternate	cm90 2.75 /gal.	NA /gal.	Rs-2 2.31 /gal.	/gal.	/gal.	/gal.
Alternate	cm150 3.10 /gal.	NA /gal.	chiplockC 1.78 /gal.	/gal.	/gal.	/gal.

NOTES: