

VAN BUREN COUNTY ROAD COMMISSION

**"22A Contract Gravel Resurfacing"**

TUESDAY, February 1, 2022 at 11:00 AM

	Contractor <b>Aggregate Industries</b>	Contractor <b>Yerington Brothers</b>	Contractor <b>R. Smith &amp; Sons</b>	Contractor <b>Kalin Construction</b>	Contractor
ALMENA TOWNSHIP (3,00 tons)	-	\$9.68	\$12.12	\$12.46	
ARLINGTON TOWNSHIP (965 tons)	-	\$9.18	\$12.48	No Bid	
BANGOR TOWNSHIP (1,000 tons)	-	\$9.62	\$12.58	No Bid	
BLOOMINGDALE TOWNSHIP (180 tons)	-	\$10.89	\$12.58	No Bid	
COLUMBIA TOWNSHIP (2,960 tons)	-	\$10.89	\$11.80	No Bid	
GENEVA TOWNSHIP (900 tons)	-	\$11.15	\$12.58	No Bid	
HAMILTON TOWNSHIP (3,000 tons)	-	\$8.84	\$10.20	\$9.43	
KEELER TOWNSHIP (3,000 tons)	-	\$9.06	\$10.20	\$10.99	
LAWRENCE TOWNSHIP (1,400 tons)	-	\$7.98	\$11.32	No Bid	
PAW PAW TOWNSHIP (5,500 tons)	-	\$8.09	\$10.20	\$10.99	
PINE GROVE TOWNSHIP (2,000 tons)	-	\$11.10	\$10.98	No Bid	
PORTER TOWNSHIP (4,000 tons)	-	\$9.58	\$14.50	\$11.67	
WAVERLY TOWNSHIP (4,000 tons)	-	\$9.24	\$11.78	No Bid	
VAN BUREN COUNTY ROAD COMM. (Boudreau Pit) (3,500 tons)	\$12.49	\$7.74	\$11.20	\$11.67	
BANGOR (WESTERN) GARAGE (1,600 tons)	\$11.84	\$9.29	\$12.60	No Bid	
BLOOMINGDALE GARAGE (2,000 tons)	\$11.42	\$10.49	\$11.32	No Bid	