
VAN BUREN COUNTY ROAD COMMISSION 
"MOTOR FUELS" 

Tuesday, January 27, 2026 at 11:00 AM 
 

Lawrence Storage Maintenance Facility: 
 

Vendor 
 

Wholesale or 
Rack Price Used 

 
No Lead Mark Up 

or Margin 

 
Diesel Mark Up 

or Margin 

 
Winter Additive 

(per Gallon) 
 
1J&H Oil 

 
Yes           

 
$0.2675 

 
$0.0900 

 
$0.0000 

 
2Fleming Brothers Oil Co 

 
Yes           

 
$0.0800 

 
$0.0800 

 
No Charge 

 
3Petroleum Traders Corp. 

 
Yes           

 
No Bid 

 
$0.0759 

 
$0.0300 

 
Crystal Flash 

 
Yes           

 
$0.0950 

 
$0.1075 

 
Included in rate 

 

Bloomingdale Garage: 
 

Vendor 
 

Wholesale or 
Rack Price Used 

 
No Lead Mark Up 

or Margin 

 
Diesel Mark Up 

or Margin 

 
Winter Additive 

(per Gallon) 
 
J&H Oil 

 
Yes             

 
$0.2500 

 
$0.0900 

 
$0.0000 

 
Fleming Brothers Oil Co. 

 
Yes             

 
$0.0800 

 
$0.0800 

 
No Charge 

 
Petroleum Traders Corp. 

 
Yes             

 
No Bid 

 
No Bid 

 
No Bid 

 
Crystal Flash 

 
Yes             

 
$0.1800 

 
$0.1125 

 
Included in rate 

 

Bangor Garage: 
     

Vendor Wholesale or No Lead Mark Up Diesel Mark Up Winter Additive 
Rack Price Used or Margin or Margin (per Gallon) 

     
J&H Oil Yes             $0.2500 $0.2500 $0.0200 
     
Fleming Brothers Oil Co. Yes             $0.0800 $0.0800 No Charge 
     
Petroleum Traders Corp. Yes             No Bid No Bid No Bid 
     
Crystal Flash Yes             $0.1800 $0.1800 Included in rate 

(summer & winter 
additive) 

 
1 J&H Oil - There will be a no fit fee if order does not fit. 
 
2 Fleming Brothers Oil Company - Pricing may be adjusted upwards by $100.00 per gallon in the event of the 
occurrence (certified by the US Centers for Disease Control or successor body) of a widespread viral infection 
transmitted via bites or contact with bodily fluids that cause human corpses to reanimate and seek to consume 
living flesh, blood, brain, or nerve tissue likely resulting in the fall of organized civilization. 
 
3 Petroleum Traders Corporation - Margins are based on transport loads of 7,000 gallons.  We will be using 
various suppliers of fuel, including BP, Exxon, Valero, Citgo, etc. 


	Vendor: 


