

VAN BUREN COUNTY ROAD COMMISSION

**"22A Contract Gravel Resurfacing"**

TUESDAY, February 21, 2023 at 11:00 AM

Township	Quantity (Tons)	Contractor <b>Yerington Bros</b>	Contractor <b>Aggregate Industries</b>	Contractor <b>Kalin Construction</b>	Contractor <b>StoneCo.</b>	Contractor <b>R. Smith &amp; Sons</b>
ARLINGTON TOWNSHIP	800	\$11.85	NA	No Bid	\$10.45	\$10.83
BANGOR TOWNSHIP	2,500	\$13.10	NA	No Bid	\$10.40	\$11.75
BLOOMINGDALE TOWNSHIP	3,000	\$13.55	NA	No Bid	\$9.50	\$9.90
COLUMBIA TOWNSHIP	1,750	\$13.72	NA	No Bid	\$9.75	\$10.75
GENEVA TOWNSHIP	763	\$14.32	NA	No Bid	\$10.00	\$13.88
HAMILTON TOWNSHIP	3,000	\$10.87	NA	\$13.01	\$10.00	\$10.70
KEELER TOWNSHIP	3,000	\$11.89	NA	\$13.90	\$11.05	\$10.70
PAW PAW TOWNSHIP	5,500	\$10.95	NA	\$14.79	\$9.75	\$12.95
PINE GROVE TOWNSHIP	3,000	\$14.75	NA	No Bid	\$10.40	\$9.65
WAVERLY TOWNSHIP	1,000	\$11.70	NA	No Bid	\$9.75	\$9.75
VAN BUREN COUNTY ROAD COMM. (Boudreau Pit)	3,500	\$10.04	\$14.40	\$14.79	\$9.25	\$13.50
BANGOR (WESTERN) GARAGE	1,600	\$12.95	\$14.40	No Bid	\$9.60	\$11.87
BLOOMINGDALE GARAGE	2,000	\$13.15	\$13.65	No Bid	\$9.25	\$9.65