
(Prices Per Linear Foot)

REINFORCED CONCRETE

Contractor 12" 15" 18" 21" 24" 30" 36" 42" 48"

Cadillac Culvert, Inc. No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Jensen Bridge & Supply No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Northern Concrete Pipe 15.66$              19.64$               25.88$              32.00$              39.98$              63.76$                85.28$              108.92$            142.60$             Delivery Charge applies unless full 

truck load.  Pricing is good thru 

December 31 2024.  Pickup 

allowance 7% off pricing shown.

CL-IV RCP Reinforced Concrete 

*St. Regis Culvert No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

CORRUGATED OR SPIRAL RIBBED AL-ALLOY

Contractor 12" 15" 18" 21" 24" 30" 36" 42" 48" 2'0" Connecting Bands Each

*Cadillac Culvert, Inc. 9.25 (16 ga.) 11.60 (16 ga.) 14.02 (16 ga.) 16.50 (16 ga.) 23.98 (14 ga.) 29.71 (14 ga.) 35.82 (14 ga.) 42.50 (14 ga) 47.60 (14 ga.) 2' of pipe Corrugated al-alloy to 2 Alum

Jensen Bridge & Supply 8.97 (16 ga.) 11.25 (16 ga.) 13.54 (16 ga.) 15.71 (16 ga.) 22.48 (14 ga.) 27.97 (14 ga.) 34.00 (14 ga.) 40.66 (14 ga.) 60.58 (12 ga.) 2x per ft of pipe Corrugated Alumized T-2 Pipe

St. Regis Culvert 10.00 (16 ga.) 12.00 (16 ga.) 15.00 (16 ga.) 17.00 (16 ga.) 19.00 (16 ga.) 30.00 (14 ga.) 36.00 (14 ga.) 42.00 (14 ga.) 65.00 (12 ga.) No price

CORRUGATED OR SPIRAL RIBBED STEEL

Contractor 12" 15" 18" 21" 24" 30" 36" 42" 48" 2'0" Connecting Bands Each

Cadillac Culvert, Inc. 8.28 (16 ga.) 10.39 (16 ga.) 12.56 (16 ga.) 14.75 (16 ga.) 16.82 (16 ga.) 26.14 (14 ga.) 31.78 (14 ga.) 37.71 (14 ga.) 59.70 (12 ga.) 2' of pipe Corrugated Galvanized

Jensen Bridge & Supply 7.55 (16 ga.) 9.38 (16 ga.) 11.45 (16 ga.) 13.88 (16 ga.) 19.00 (14 ga.) 24.10 (14 ga.) 29.10 (14 ga.) 34.80 (14 ga.) 54.95 (12 ga.) 2x per ft of pipe Corrugated Metal Pipe Galvanized

St. Regis Culvert 7.85 (16 ga.) 9.48 (16 ga.) 11.93 (16 ga.) 13.60 (16 ga.) 15.20 (16 ga.) 24.30 (14 ga.) 29.16 (14 ga.) 34.45 (14 ga.) 53.95 (12 ga.) No price Corrugated steel

DUAL-WALL POLYMER-PRECOATED GALVANIZED STEEL

Contractor 12" 15" 18" 21" 24" 30" 36" 42" 48" 2'0" Connecting Bands Each

Cadillac Culvert, Inc. 12.49 (16 ga.) 15.53 (16 ga.) 18.77 (16 ga.) 21.80 (16 ga.) 25.36 (16 ga.) 39.11 (14 ga.) 47.56 (14 ga.) 55.95 (14 ga.) 86.90 (12 ga.) 2' of pipe Polymer precoated galvanized steel

Jensen Bridge & Supply 12.59 (16 ga.) 15.58 (16 ga.) 18.65 (16 ga.) 21.59 (16 ga.) 29.32 (14 ga.) 36.50 (14 ga.) 44.83 (14 ga.) 51.23 (14 ga.) 74.63 (12 ga.) 2x per ft of pipe Corrugated Polymer-precoated-galvanized steel pipe

St. Regis Culvert 13.00 (16 ga.) 15.60 (16 ga.) 19.50 (16 ga.) 23.50 (16 ga.) 25.10 (16 ga.) 31.70 (16 ga.) 28.30 (16 ga.) 48.33 (16 ga.) 56.86 (16 ga.) No price

VAN BUREN COUNTY ROAD COMMISSION

Various Types of Drainage Pipe

April 2, 2024 at 11:00 AM



SMOOTH-LINED CORRUGATED PLASTIC (CPE)

Contractor 12" 15" 18" 21" 24" 30" 36" 42" 48"

Advanced Drainage Systems 5.88$                8.18$                 11.87$              NA 19.26$              27.81$                37.26$              56.16$              65.95$               

POLYPROPYLENE PIPE (PPP)

Contractor 12" 15" 18" 21" 24" 30" 36" 42" 48"

Advanced Drainage Systems 9.35$                13.30$               18.00$              NA 31.30$              43.65$                54.75$              74.40$              89.75$               

*Cadillac Culvert-Full truck delivery.  Freight charges may apply for less than truck load.  Prices firm for 60 days.

*St. Regis Culvert-Prices firm for 60 days from bid date.  

Alternate Bids


